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BID NOVEMBER 17, 1999 

COMPLETED MAY 2, 2001 

 

COST: $4,874,994 

 

ADDITIONS OF 18,500 S.F. 

ALTERATIONS OF 13,600 S.F. 

TOTAL OF 32,100 S.F. 

The design of this complete 
renovation and expansion of 
City offices brings them under 
one roof while providing an 
efficient organization of space 
for each department. 
 
Adm in is t r a t i ve ,  W age ,    
Treasurer, Finance, Planning 
and Community Development 
are all located on the upper 
floor.  The Police Department 
occupies the lower floor.  The 
intermediate level provides 
space for the public meeting 
room and conference rooms.  
State of the art voice, data 
and video communication 
links offices and meeting 
rooms for multiple functions 
and uses. 
 
The building’s aesthetics 
were designed to reflect the 
City’s signature role in the 
community, while creating a 
corporate atmosphere for its 
employees and visitors. 
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